
 

JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
Deborah L. Clark, County Purchasing Agent 

 

 

1149 Pearl Street, Beaumont, TX  77701  409-835-8593  Fax 409-835-8456 

 
CURRENT PRICING 

IFB 19-056/YS 

Term Contract for Gray Limestone (Commonly Referred to as 610 Base) for Jefferson County 

Awarded:  November 19, 2019 

 
Renewal 1:  11/18/2020-11/17/2021       updated:  10/15/2024 

Renewal 2: 11/16/2021 – 11/15/2022 

Renewal 3: 11/15/2022 – 11/14/2023 

Renewal 4: 11/14/2023 – 11/13/2023 

Extension : 11/13/2024 – 01/12/2025 

 

Gulf Coast, a CRH 

Company 

Knife River Corporation 

- South 
A.  Gray Limestone Base - 

delivered from vendor's hopper to 

job site. 

Price per ton, 

tandem dump 

Price per ton, 

trailer 

Price per 

ton, tandem 

dump 

Price per 

ton, trailer 

1.  1 - 10 miles 

$36.75 $50.00 

$60.00 

$36.75 $50.00 

$60.00 $70.00   No Bid 

2.  11 – 20 miles 

$39.45 $52.00 

$62.00 

$36.75 $52.00 

$62.00 $72.00   No Bid 

3.  21 – 30 miles 

$42.60 $54.00 

$64.00 

$37.75 $54.00 

$64.00 $74.00   No Bid 

4.  31 + miles 

$44.95 $57.00 

$67.00 

$39.75 $57.00 

$67.00 $77.00   No Bid 

     

B.  Hopper Pick Up 

Gulf Coast, a CRH 

Company 

Knife River Corporation 

– South 

Location Address Price per ton Address Price per ton 

1.  Beaumont 860 Pine Street 

$31.75 $42.00 

$50.00 $58.00     

2.  Port Neches         

3.  Port Arthur         

4.  Other     Bridge City 
$38.00  

$45.00 

5.  Other         

Hours of Hopper Operation Mon-Fri, 7am - 4 pm     

Loose weight in lbs/cy 2500 lbs/cy     

     

Gulf Coast, a CRH Company  Knife River Corporation - South  

PO Box 20779  PO Box 20257   

Beaumont TX  77720  Beaumont TX  77720  

attn:  Jeremy Hemmings  attn:  Toby C. Burns  

jeremy.hemmings@texasmaterials.com  toby.burns@kniferiver.com  

ph:  409-718-8082  ph:  409-842-9393  

 

mailto:toby.burns@kniferiver.com

