
Final Tabulation

IFB 19-040/YS, Term Contract for Road Building Materials for Jefferson County

Bid Opening:  August 27, 2019

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.90 85.22 85.06

2 Item 302  Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.90 85.22 85.06

3 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.90 85.22 85.06

*minimum 24 ton delivery

1 Item 302 Type B Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.42 82.02 84.74 84.42

2 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.42 82.02 84.74 84.42

3 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.42 82.02 84.74 84.42

*minimum 24 ton delivery

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.34 66.34 66.34

2 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.34 66.34 66.34

3 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.34 66.34 66.34

*minimum 4000 ton delivery

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1B.  Rock Asphalt - Truck Delivery (Price 

per ton, FOB delivered Jefferson County Precinct 

Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and Allowed)

A.  Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregates 

for Surface Treatments

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

Gulf Coast

B.  Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for 

Surface Treatments

Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

1A.  Rock Asphalt - Truck Delivery (Price 

per ton, FOB, delivered Jefferson County Precinct 

Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and Allowed)
LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Vulcan Construction Materials 

LLC

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd
A.  Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregated 

for Surface Treatments

Gulf Coast

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.
Vulcan Construction Materials 

LLC

Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire HebertHamshireRosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelleRosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.

1C.  Rock Asphalt - Railroad Delivery 
(Price per ton, FOB Delivered Jefferson County 

Precinct Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and 

Allowed)

A.  Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregated 

for Surface Treatments

B.  Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for 

Surface Treatments

China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.

B.  Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for 

Surface Treatments



Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.34 66.34 66.34 66.34

2 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.34 66.34 66.34 66.34

3 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.34 66.34 66.34 66.34

*minimum 4000 ton delivery

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.  Flexible Base, Item 247, Ty A, Gr 1 CLA (Minimum P.I. 4 - Maximum P.I. 10)

1.  1 -10 miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.00 29.00 28.00 28.00

2.  11 - 20 miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00 30.00 29.00 29.00

3.  21- 30 miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.00 34.00 30.50 30.50

4.  31 + miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.00 39.00 36.00 36.00

*minimum 24 ton delivery

B.  Hopper Pick-Up

Location

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

Hours of Hopper Operation:

25.00

No Bid

25.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

7 am - 5 pm  *minimum 24 ton delivery

No Bid

No Bid

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

1399 Carroll Street 22.50

No Bid

No Bid

2525 Dollinger Road

2190 S Gulfway Drive

Gulf Coast LD Construction

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

Gulf Coast LD Construction

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Martin Marietta 

Materials, Inc.

Price per ton, 

tandem 

dump

Price per ton, 

trailer

Vulcan Construction 

Materials LLC

Price per ton, 

tandem dump

Price per ton, 

trailer

Price per ton, 

trailer

Gulf Coast LD Construction

Price per ton, 

tandem 

dump

Price per ton, 

trailer

1D.  Rock Asphalt - Railroad Delivery 
(Price per ton, FOB Delivered Jefferson County 

Precinct Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and 

Allowed)

A.  Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregates 

for Surface Treatments

B.  Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for 

Surface Treatments

A.  Truck Delivery - Prices FOB Delivered with 

Freight Prepaid and Allowed by Type of 

Equipment Indicated.  Flexible Base - Price per 

ton delivered from Vendor's hopper to job site.  

Bidder shall supply material from location 

closest to the County project site.
Price per ton, 

tandem dump



3.  CMD-9000-002 Asphaltic Concrete Patching Material (Stockpile Storage)

1.  1 - 10 miles 95.00 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.  11 - 20 miles 97.70 97.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.  21 - 30 miles 100.85 100.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.  31+ miles 103.20 103.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

B.  Hopper Pick-Up

Location

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

Hours of Hopper Operation:

4A.  Cement Stabilized Base - Truck Delivery (price per ton, FOB delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Center with freight prepaid and allowed)

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00 44.00 44.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00 44.50 45.00 44.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.00 47.00 47.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.00 47.50 48.00 47.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

B-2.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 2 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

B-1.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 2 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

A-2.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 1-

1/2 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

A-1.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 1-

1/2 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

No Bid

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

Mon-Fri, 7am-4pm

No Bid

LD Construction

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

90.00

No Bid

No Bid

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

Gulf Coast

860 Pine Street

Martin Marietta 

Materials, Inc.

Price per ton, 

tandem 

dump

Price per ton, 

trailer

Vulcan Construction 

Materials LLC

Price per ton, 

tandem dump

Price per ton, 

trailer

Price per ton, 

trailer

Gulf Coast LD Construction

Price per ton, 

tandem 

dump

Price per ton, 

trailer

A.  Truck Delivery-Prices FOB Delivered with 

Freight Prepaid and Allowed by Type of 

Equipment Indicated.  Patching Material-Price 

per ton delivered from Vendor's hopper to job 

site.  Bidder shall apply material from location 

closest to the County project site.

Price per ton, 

tandem dump



China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00 53.00 53.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00 53.50 54.00 53.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60.00 59.00 59.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60.00 59.50 60.00 59.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 92.00/cy 92.00/cy 92.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 92.00/cy 92.00/cy 92.00/cy 92.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 95.00/cy 95.00/cy 95.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 95.00/cy 95.00/cy 95.00/cy 95.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 101.00/cy 101.00/cy 101.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 101.00/cy 101.00/cy 101.00/cy 101.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

G-1.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 3 sack/ton

G-2.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 3 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

F-1.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 2 sack/ton

F-2.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 2 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

E-2.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 1-1/2 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

E-1.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 1-1/2 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

D-2.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 4 

sack/ton
Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

D-1.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 4 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

C-2.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 3 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

C-1.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 3 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC



China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd China Rd Viterbo Rd Boyt Rd

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 107.00/cy 107.00/cy 107.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 107.00/cy 107.00/cy 107.00/cy 107.00/cy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4B.  Cement Stabilized Base - Hopper Pick Up

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other No Bid No BidNo Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

88.00/cy No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 2525 Dollinger

No Bid No Bid

C.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 1-1/2 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

42.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 2525 Dollinger

B.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 2 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

LD Construction

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

A.  Item 276, Plant Mix, Crushed Stone, 1-1/2 

sack/ton

Gulf Coast

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

2525 Dollinger 39.00

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

H-1.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 4 sack/ton

H-2.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 4 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.



1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

5.  Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - Hopper Pick-Up

Location

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

Hours of Hopper Operation:

Location

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

Hours of Hopper Operation: Mon-Fri, 7 am - 4 pm

Gulf Coast LD Construction

No Bid

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

860 Pine Street 63.50 2360 Dollinger 58.75 No Bid No Bid

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

B.  Item 340 TY D - Anti Stripping Agent shall be 

added if required by design mix

A.  Item 340 TY D

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

Mon-Fri, 7 am - 4 pm

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

860 Pine Street 63.50 2360 Dollinger 58.75 No Bid No Bid

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

No Bid No Bid

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

97.00/cy No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

E.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 3 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

91.00/cy No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

D.  Item 401, Flowable Backfill, 2 sack/ton

Gulf Coast LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point



6.  Hot Mix Cold Laid Asphaltic Concret Pavement - Hopper Pick-Up

Location

1.  Beaumont

2.  Port Neches

3.  Port Arthur

4.  Other

5.  Other

Hours of Hopper Operation:

7.  Concrete Structures - Truck Delivery

1.  Item 421 Class A

2.  Item 421 Class B

3.  Item 421 Class S

Gulf Coast, a CRH Company Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.
PO Box 20779 5675 Fannett Road

Beaumont TX  77720 Beaumont TX  77705

attn:  Rebecca Rutlege attn:  Bill Kelley

Rebecca.Rutledge@gc-texas.com william.kelley@martinmarietta.com

ph:  409-284-2600 or 409-866-1444 ph:  658-7791

fx:  409-866-1032 fx:  409-654-3312

LD Construction Vulcan Construction Materials LLC
148 South Dowlen Road, PHB 694 PO Box 791550

Beaumont TX  77707 San Antonio TX  78279

attn:  Troy Dodson attn:  Jeff Harris

troy.ldconstruction@gmail.com vulcantxquotes@vmcmail.com

ph:  409-656-4161 ph:  210-524-3512

fx:  409-866-4447 fx:  210-524-3555

No Bid No Bid 102.00/cy No Bid

No Bid No Bid 98.00/cy No Bid

No Bid No Bid 94.00/cy No Bid

A.  Item 334, Type D LD Construction Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Vulcan Construction Materials LLC

A.  Delivered to Job Site, Jefferson County, 

price per ton FOB truck shipping point
Gulf Coast LD Construction

Martin Marietta 

Materials, Inc.

Vulcan Construction 

Materials LLC

Mon-Fri, 7 am - 4 pm

Gulf Coast

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point

860 Pine Street 73.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Address
Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

Price per ton FOB truck 

shipping point
Address

mailto:Rebecca.Rutledge@gc-texas.com
mailto:william.kelley@martinmarietta.com
mailto:troy.ldconstruction@gmail.com
mailto:vulcantxquotes@vmcmail.com

