
Final Tabulation

IFB 18-017/YS, Term Contract for Microfilm Supplies for Jefferson County

Bids Opened:  Tuesday, June 26, 2018

Item Catalog Number Description Est. Qty.
Unit of 

Measure

Item Number 

and Name
Unit Price

Item Number 

and Name
Unit Price

Item Number 

and Name
Unit Price

Item Number 

and Name
Unit Price

1 102-2490

Imagelink 

Archive 

Processor 

Developer

8 case
EPM cat #1112490 

two 5-liter 

bottles/case

163.40/case EPM 1112490 128.65 NO BID NO BID Fuji #140 4x1 gal/case 86.93

2 102-2656

Imagelink 

Archive 

Processor 

Fixer

Unavailable case

EPM cat #1112656 

two 5-liter 

bottles/case -

E030227

126.96/case EPM 1112490 93.05 NO BID NO BID Fuji #141 4x1 gal/case 50.61

3 199-0977

Kodak 

Prostar Tape 

& Dispenser

Unavailable each
EPM cat#199-0977 

sold by each
74.50/each 42.50 NO BID NO BID Kodak 199-0977 32.26

4 146-5194

Imagelink 

16mm Dual 

Strand

10 box
EPM cat #146-5194 

priced by each, 3 per 

pack

97.20/pack 64.40 NO BID NO BID Kodak 146-5194 21.60

5 78-6969-7542-0

3M Brand 

Cartridges 

for 

Microfilm

Unavailable case

Microfilm Products 

cat #I850H, 100 M 

cartridges w/t 

leaders per case - 

M202060

540.00/case 600.00 NO BID NO BID
Zeta beige msbg 

100/cs
633.18

6 33NXDM

Imagelink 

Archive 

Storage 

Media, 100 

rolls/case

2 case
EPM cat#334NXDM 

priced per roll/100 

rolls per case

3260.00/case 2922.00 NO BID NO BID
Fuji FM66 16mmx215' 

100/cs new universal
3099.23

7 149-0481

Kodak 

Microfilm 

Press 16mm - 

not 

perforated, 

500 splices

4 box
Microfilm Products 

cat #I-528, 1,000 

splices per case

93.96/box
Discontinued, 

substitute Taylor
85.00 I-528 98.30

Zeta cr-16 roll clear 

1,000/cs
59.99

8 150-0719

Kodak 

System 

Cleaner - for 

developer, 

10 gal/case

Unavailable case
EPM cat #150-0719  

10 gals per case, 

priced by case

93.96/box 215.35 NO BID NO BID Kodak 150-0719 139.49

9 139-5110

Kodak 

System 

Cleaner for 

Fixer, 4 

gal/case

Unavailable case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Kodak139-5110 10/cs 215.68

10 144-2433

Kodak Solid 

Flange 

Return 

Reels, 35 

mm, 100 ft, 

Thread-Easy

Unavailable case
EPM cat#144-2433, 

priced by the reel, 

150 per case

265.00/case
Discontinued, 

substitute EPM 

3342441

263.50 NO BID NO BID
Zeta SFR3555 solid 

flange 250/cs
286.60

11 FR-32-049

Pro-Star Plus 

Developer, 4 

gal/case

Unavailable case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 32-249 115.60 NO BID NO BID

12 FR-32-254

Pro-Star 

Microfilm 

Fixer, 4 

gal/case

8 case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 32-254 93.50 NO BID NO BID

13 873-0715

Kodak 

16mm Solid 

Flange 

Return 

Microfilm 

Reels, 

500/case

Unavailable case
EPM cat#873-0715, 

priced by the reel, 

300 reels per case

322.00/case                                 

(1.073/ea)
300/case

495.00                                       

(1.65/ea)
NO BID NO BID

Zeta SFW SS/SR 

500/cs

373.24                              

(.746/ea)

DecisionOne Corp Western Micrographics Windward GroupEndicott Microfilm, Inc.

DecisionOne Corp                                                
640 Lee Road, 3rd Floor                                     

Wayne PA  19087                                                    

attn:  Jeanette Anderson                                            

Jeanette.anderson@decisionone.com                          

ph:  610-745-3801                                                                      

fx:  800-984-6443

Endicott Microfilm, Inc.                             
642 High Street                                          

Hamilton OH  45011                                

attn:  Len Weber                                        

endicott@choice.net                                

ph:  800-875-8424                                    

fx:  513-868-6365

Western Micrographics & Imaging 

Systems                                                                     
11665 Fuqua Street, Suite C308                      

Houston TX  77034                                                 

attn:  Ruth J. Shearer                                           

West4320@sbcglobal.net                                 

ph:  281-481-8833                                                 

fx:  281-481-8838

The Windward Group LLC                                 
265 General Patton Avenue                             

Mandeville LA  70471                                          

attn:  Ellen Skaggs                                                

eskaggs@thewindwardgroup.net                 

ph:  985-893-4606                                                 

fx:  985-893-0106


