

Final Tabulation
 IFB 24-032/MR
 Term Contract for Herbicides for Jack Brooks Regional Airport
 Awarded: July 30, 2024

Item	Description	Red River Specialties, LLC				Opterra Solutions				SiteOne Landscape Supply			
		Container Size	Brand bid	MSDS Labels Attached	Price per Container	Container Size	Brand bid	MSDS Labels Attached	Price per Container	Container Size	Brand bid	MSDS Labels Attached	Price per Container
1	POLARIS or equivalent	2.5 Gallon	Arsenal Herbicide	Yes	\$146.10	2.5 Gallon	Polaris	Yes	\$146.50	2.5 Gallon	Nufarm	Yes	\$380.28
2	Roundup or equivalent	2.5 Gallon	Ranger Pro	Yes	\$37.25	2.5 Gallon	GlyStar Plus	Yes	\$40.75	2.5 Gallon	Ranger Pro	Yes	\$44.04
3	Opensight	1.25 Pounds	Opensight	Yes	\$122.50	1.25 Pounds	Opensight	Yes	\$122.00	1.25 Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4a	Esplanade 200 SC	Quart	Esplande 200 SC	Yes	\$415.36	Quart	Esplande	Yes	\$415.36	Quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4b	Esplanade 200 SC	2.5 Gallon	Esplande 200 SC	Yes	\$3,772.80	2.5 Gallon	Esplande	Yes	\$3,772.80	2.5 Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Oust Extra or equivalent	4 Pounds	Oust Extra	Yes	\$103.25	4 Pounds	SFM Extra	Yes	\$116.00	4 Pounds (Bid on 3 Pounds)	Bayer	Yes	\$202.28
6	Sunset Sufactant or equivalent	2.5 Gallon	Sunset	Yes	\$34.40	2.5 Gallon	Sunset	Yes	\$50.00	2.5 Gallon	LESCO	Yes	\$51.00
7a	Plateau or equivalent	2.5 Gallon	Plateau	Yes	\$282.20	2.5 Gallon	Panoramic	Yes	\$287.50	2.5 Gallon (Bid on 1 Gallon)	BASF	Yes	\$145.00
7b	Plateau or equivalent	5 Gallon	Plateau	yes	\$564.40	5 Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5 Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	24-D or equivalent	2.5 Gallon	Weedar 64	yes	\$38.20	2.5 Gallon	2,4D Amine	Yes	\$40.00	2.5 Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Garlon 4 or equivalent	2.5 Gallon	Element	yes	\$155.00	2.5 Gallon	Garlon 4	Yes	\$130.00	2.5 Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Red River Specialties, LLC
 1324 North Hearne Ave, Ste 120
 Shreveport, LA 71107
 Attn: Chad Chambliss
 318-425-5944
chad.chambliss@azelis.com

Opterra Solutions, Inc.
 270 Bruner Rd.
 Lexington, SC 29072
 Attn: Lance Daniel
 803-957-8989
bids@opterrasolutions.com

SiteOne Landscape Supply
 1385 East 36th Street
 Cleveland, OH 44114
 Attn: Rosalin Santiago
 216-706-9250
bids@siteone.com