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Attachment A                                   JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DIVISION
Deborah L.C lark, County Purchasing Agent

 
 

 
1149 Pearl Street, Beaumont, TX  77701  409-835-8593  Fax 409-835-8456 

 

IFB 09-119/KJS – Term Contract for Paper Stock & Envelopes for Jefferson County 
Final Tab – September 8, 2009 

Please call Karen J. Smith at 409-835-8693 with questions or corrections. 
 
 

  Olmstead Kirk Xerox ARK World LLC Scott Merriman 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Paper Stock 
1 20 lb. Bond Paper, long 

grain, white 8½x11 
Paper grade:  Prem. #4 

$5.60 $28.00 $5.932 $29.66 $11.33 $56.65 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Zoom Xerox 4200 IP Hammerhill  

2 20 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x11, 3-hole 
punched 
Paper grade:  Prem. #4 

$6.48 $32.40 $7.79 $38.95 $16.26 $81.30 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Domtar Multiuse Xerox 4200 IP Hammerhill  

3 20 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x14 
Paper grade:  Prem, #4 

$8.24 $41.20 $9.20 $46.00 $18.70 $93.50 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Domtar Multiuse Xerox 4200 IP Hammerhill  

4 20 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 11x17 
Paper grade:  Prem. #4 

$12.95 $32.38 $14.38 $35.95 $30.40 $76.00 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Domtar Multiuse Xerox 4200 IP Hammerhill  

5 24 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x11 
Paper grade:  Laser Print 
#1 

$10.87 $54.35 $9.20 $46.00 $22.58 $112.90 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Hammermill Xerox 4200 IP Hammermill   
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  Olmstead Kirk Xerox ARK World LLC Scott Merriman 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

6 24 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x14 
Paper grade:  Laser Print 
#1 

$13.81 $69.05 No Bid No Bid $29.30 $146.50 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Hammermill  IP Hammermill   

7 20 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, colors (peach, or-
chid, cherry, ivory, grey), 
8½x11 – ream wrap only 
(combined total).   
Paper grade:  prem, #4 

$7.66 $38.30 $7.392 $36.96 $15.71 $78.55 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Fore MP Xerox 4200 IP Hammerhill  

8 20 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, colors (peach, or-
chid, cherry, ivory, grey), 
8½x14 – ream wrap only 
(combined total).   
Paper grade:  prem, #4 

$10.47 $52.35 No Bid No Bid $22.88 $114.40 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Fore MP  IP Hammerhill  

9 20 lb. Bond Paper, colors 
(buff, salmon, goldenrod, 
pink, blue, canary, green), 
8½x11 

$7.66 $38.30 $7.392 $36.96 $15.71 $78.55 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Fore MP Xerox 4200 IP Hammerhill  

10 20 lb. Bond Paper, long 
grain, colors (ivory, 
goldenrod, pink, blue, 
canary, green), 8½x14 

$10.47 $52.35 No Bid No Bid $22.88 $114.40 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Fore MP  IP Hammerhill  

          
11 20 lb. Bond Paper, 25% 

rag, long grain, cockle 
finish, white, 8½x11.  
Paper grade:  #1 

$15.57 $62.28 No Bid No Bid $51.60 $258.00 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Royal Cotton  Neenah Bond  
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  Olmstead Kirk Xerox ARK World LLC Scott Merriman 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

12 20 lb. Bond Paper, 25% 
rag, long grain, cockle 
finish, white, 8½x14.  
Paper grade:  #1 

$39.00 $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Royal Cotton    

Card Stock 
13 67 lb. Vellum cover stock 

(white) 8½x11, shrink wrap 
acceptable (combined 
total).  Paper grade:  #4 

$15.24 $30.48 No Bid No Bid $35.68 $71.36 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Springhill  IP Springhill  

14 67 lb. Vellum cover stock 
(aqua, green, gold, blue, 
pink, ivory, yellow, grey) 
8½x11, shrink wrap 
acceptable (combined 
total).  Paper grade:  #4 

$16.21 $32.42 No Bid No Bid $37.00 $74.00 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Springhill  IP Springhill  

15 20 lb. #1 White Sulfite, long 
grain white, 8½x11 
Hammermill.  Paper grade:  
Grade 1 watermark 

$11.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid $23.65 $118.20 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Hammermill  IP Hammermill  

16 81/2x14 100 pound manila 
Springhill Tag 

$46.57 $46.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Springhill    

17 8X8 110lb. Springfield 
index White 

$27.36 $27.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Springhill    

18 Hammermill Accent 
Opaque 28/70 pound 
white-vellum Finish, Long 
Grain, 81/2x11 

$10.50 $31.50 No Bid No Bid $25.25 $101.00 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Exact Ice  IP Hammermill  
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  Olmstead Kirk Xerox ARK World LLC Scott Merriman 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

19 Brite Hue-60 Pound Text & 
Cover 81/2X11(Red, 
Violet,Green,Orange,Ultra 
Fuchsia) 

$14.26 $71.30 No Bid No Bid $33.76 $168.80 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand AstroBright  Wausau Astro Bright  

20 #80 81/2X11 Classic Crest 
Avon Brilliant White 

$58.60 $117.20 No Bid No Bid $123.00 $226.0 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Classic Crest  Neenah Classic Crest  

21 #80 81/2X11 Classic Crest 
Avon Brilliant Ivory 

$58.60 $117.20 No Bid No Bid $124.75 $249.50 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Classic Crest  Neenah Classic Crest  

Envelopes 
22 24 lb. catalog envelopes 

10”x13” white woven 
$56.65 $28.33 No Bid No Bid $91.31 $45.65 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

23 28 lb. white catalog 
envelopes 9”x12” 

$49.35 $24.68 No Bid No Bid $108.14 $54.07 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

24 15”x10” brown kraft 
gummed flap document 
envelopes 32# 

$146.00 $36.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO 28#    

25 #9 window envelopes – 24 
lb. white wove 

$16.15 $40.38 No Bid No Bid $32.17 $80.43 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

26 #9 regular envelopes – 24 
lb. white wove 

$13.55 $33.88 No Bid No Bid $28.43 $71.07 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

27 #10 window envelopes – 
24 lb. white wove (hard 
boxes) 

$16.15 $40.38 No Bid  No Bid $33.17 $82.92 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

28 #10 regular envelopes – 24 
lb. white wove (hard boxes) 

$13.55 $33.88 No Bid  No Bid $28.43 $71.07 No Bid No Bid 
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  Olmstead Kirk Xerox ARK World LLC Scott Merriman 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

29 #11 window envelopes – 
28 lb. white wove 

$37.00 $92.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO #24    

30 #11 regular envelopes – 28 
lb. white wove 

$49.00 $122.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO    

31 #12 window envelopes – 
24 lb. white wove 

$41.50 $103.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO    

32 #12 regular envelopes – 24 
lb. white wove 

$35.40 $88.50 No Bid No Bid $58.50 $146.25 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

33 #10 brown kraft envelopes 
– 28 lb. 

$30.90 $77.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO    

34 #12 brown kraft envelopes 
– 28 lb. 

$51.40 $128.50 No Bid No Bid $78.05 $195.13 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO  OKCO  

35 #14 brown kraft envelopes 
– 28 lb. 

$55.45 $138.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand OKCO    

36 Opaque envelopes  - 4½x9 
(blue, green, natural, 
cream, gold, pink, gray, 
ivory, yellow) 

$26.50 $66.25 No Bid No Bid $46.75 $116.87 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Springhill #10 

41/8X91/2 

 National (IP) Springhill  

No Carbon Required Paper 
37 8½x11 CFB white-black 

image long grain 
$19.56 $97.80 $44.88 $112.20 $81.62 $408.10 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior Xerox Appleton Superior  
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  Olmstead Kirk Xerox ARK World LLC Scott Merriman 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

38 8½x14 CFB white-black 
image long grain 

$24.87 $124.35 $58.12 $145.30 $102.66 $513.30 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior Xerox Appleton Superior  

39 8½x11 2-part black image 
carbonless reverse collated 

$14.40 $72.00 No Bid No Bid $53.79 $268.95 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  

40 8½x11 Mead 3-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated 

$16.20 $81.00 No Bid No Bid $60.49 $302.45 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  

41 8½x11 Mead 4-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated 

$17.31 $86.55 No Bid No Bid $64.68 $323.40 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  

42 8½x11 Mead 5-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated 

$17.80 $89.00 No Bid No Bid $66.49 $332.45 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  

43 8½x14 Mead 2-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated 

$18.32 $91.60 No Bid No Bid $68.41 $342.05 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  

44 8½x14 Mead 3-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated 

$20.59 $102.95 No Bid No Bid $76.87 $384.35 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  

45 8½x14 Mead 4-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated 

$22.02 $110.10 No Bid No Bid $82.21 $441.05 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  

46 8½x14 Mead 5-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated 

$22.68 $113.40 No Bid No Bid $84.71 $423.55 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand Superior  Appleton Superior  
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  Olmstead Kirk Xerox ARK World LLC Scott Merriman 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

Unit Price 
Per M 

Unit Price 
Per Case 

47 81/2X11 Astro Bright Cover 
and Text 

$13.80 

$27.40 

$69.00 

$54.80 

No Bid No Bid $33.76 $168.80  

 Manufacturer & Brand 60T 

65C 

 Appleton Superior  

Reporter Pads 
48 Pro-Line Original White 

Numbered Reporter Pads 
(300 sheets/pad) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $59.30 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand   RPM Pro-Line  

49 Pro-Line Original White 
Unnumbered Reporter 
Pads (300 sheets/pad) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $59.30 No Bid No Bid 

 Manufacturer & Brand   RPM Pro-Line  

Specialty Papers 
50 14" Vital Records Bank 

Note Paper 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $750.00 $750.00 

 Manufacturer & Brand     

51 36 lb. Security Paper, 
8½x11 Certified Birth 
Certificate 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $600.00 $600.00 

 Manufacturer & Brand     

52 36 lb. Western Leger or 
Equal, 8½x14 Marriage 
License Stock 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.50 $187.50 

 
Vendors 

 
Xerox Corporation 
1303 Ridgeview Dr 
Lewisville, TX  75057 
Attn:  Michelle Sherrod 
Phone:  866-318-9719 
Fax:  866-415-5973 
 

ARK World LLC 
150 East St. 
Liberty, TX  77575 
Attn:  Andra Kubala 
Phone:  936-334-1043 
Fax: 682-292-0845 
 

Olmstead-Kirk Paper Co. 
3480 W. 12th Street 
Houston, TX  77008 
Attn:  Anne Wormall 
Phone:  713-868-1531 
Fax:  713-868-4218 
 

Scott Merriman Inc. 
11212 Goodnight Lane, #200 
Dallas, TX  75229 
Attn:  Jeff Biggs 
Phone:  800-648-7022 
Fax:  972-484-8908 
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