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Term Contract for Correctional Facility  Law Enforcement Equipment and Uniforms

Final Tabulation - August 23, 2016

Item Description Bob Barker Co. GT Distributors, Inc. ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Red the Uniform Tailor Texas Code Blue

1 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - F - LS no bid no bid no bid 42.89 46.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8600W-Z Elbeco/Z9314LCN

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

2 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - F - SS no bid no bid no bid 39.11 42.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8610W-Z Elbeco Z9814LCN

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

3 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - M - LS no bid no bid no bid

42.89 size 14-19.5                         

54.85 size 20 46.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8600-Z Elbeco Z314N

Days to delivery 15 day 15 days

4 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - M - SS no bid no bid no bid

39.11 size 14-19.5                

49.99 size 20.5                  

66.23 size 21.5 42.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8610-Z Elbeco Z314N

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

5 Male Tex-Trop Trouser E314 no bid no bid no bid 51.27 46.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8650 Elbeco E314

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

6 Elbeco Tex-Trop - F - LS no bid no bid no bid 42.89 46.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8600W-Z Elbeco 9314LCN

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

7 Elbeco Tex-Trop - F - SS no bid no bid no bid 39.11 41.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8610W-Z Elbeco 9814LCN

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

8 Elbeco Tex-Trop - M - LS no bid no bid no bid

42.89 size 14-19.5         

54.85 size 20.5 46.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8600-Z Elbeco 314N

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

9 Elbeco Tex-Trop - M - SS no bid no bid no bid

39.11 size 14-19.5                         

49.99 size 20.5                     

66.23 size 21.5 41.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8610-Z Elbeco 3314N

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

10 Female Tex-Trop Trouser E9314 no bid no bid no bid 51.27 48.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 8650 Elbeco E9314LC w/strap

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

11 Duty Jacket no bid no bid no bid

97.77 size XS-3X       

126.43 size 4X 114.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 6045 Elbeco 3900

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days



12 Coach's Windbreaker no bid no bid no bid

18.37 size XS-XL                   

21.43 size 2X                     

22.99 size 3X                      

24.47 size 4X                  

27.59 size 5X 48.00

Manufacturer/Style No. DunBrooke 8430 Dutyman J31

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

13 Raincoat w/ emblem no bid no bid no bid

173.85 size S-3X             

217.37 size 4X               

282.61 size 5X    63.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 733 Neese Industries #447RCH3M

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

14 Raincoat w/o emblem no bid no bid no bid

155.85 size S-3X                 

199.37 size 4X                  

264.65 size 5X 63.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 733 Neese Industris #447RCH3M

Days to delivery 15 days  15 days

15 Polo Shirt no bid no bid no bid

29.89 size XS-XL                    

31.41 size 2X                  

34.45 size 3X                    

35.99 size 4X     48.00

Manufacturer/Style No. SanMar T474 Propper Polo

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

16 Dutyman Garrison Belt no bid

13.47 up to size 44      

17.16 size 46-60 no bid

18.15 up to size 44              

21.59 size 46-52                       

23.11 size 54-60 18.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Dutyman 1511 Dutyman 1511 Dutyman 1511

Days to delivery 30 days 15 days 15 days

17 Kevlar Gloves no bid 33.58 no bid 34.49 32.00

Manufacturer/Style No. DAM-DMZ33-B Hatch SGK100 Strongsuit/Enforcer

Days to delivery 30 days 21 days 15 days

18 Name Badge no bid 8.87 no bid 13.21 10.90

Manufacturer/Style No. BL-J2 Blackinton J2 Blackington J2

Days to delivery 30 days 21 days 15 days
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Term Contract for Correctional Facility Law Enforcement Equipment and Uniforms

Preliminary Tabulation - August 23, 2016

Item Description Bob Barker GT Distributors, Inc. ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Red the Uniform Tailor Texas Code Blue

19 Cuff Case - Safariland 190 no bid 21.64 32.00 30.71 26.00

Manufacturer/Style No. SAF-190-41B Safariland #190 Safariland 190 Safariland 090

Days to delivery 30days 7-10 days 21 days 15 days

20 Handcuffs, Nickel 20.85 18.98 25.00 27.73 26.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Peerless SHCN PE-4710 Peerless #700C Peerless 4710 Smith & Wesson 100 Nickel

Days to delivery 10-14 days 30 days 3-5 days 21 days 15 days



21 Handcuffs, color-plated 23.50 20.91 35.00 30.61 no bid

Manufacturer/Style No. Peerless 4712-color PE-4712X Peerless #703C Peerless 4712N, O, P, R, Y

Days to delivery 10-14 days 30 days 3-5 days 21 days

22 Leg irons, standard 90.00 37.05 46.00 53.71 35.00

Manufacturer/Style No. S&W 1900 SW-350121 Peerless #703C Kroll 350155 Smith & Wesson 1900

Days to delivery 10-14 days 30 days 3-5 days 21 days 15ddays

23 One-man restraint chain 52.40 14.55 65.00 20.59 no bid

Manufacturer/Style No. Peerless BCWC 20 PE-PSC60 Peerless #PSC60 Peerless 4781

Days to delivery 10-14 days 30 days 3-5 days 21 days

24 LawPro Centurion Duty Jacket no bid no bid no bid

126.99 size XS-3X                          

165.05 size 4X                           

222.29 size 5X 67.00

Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 6120 Dutyman Jacket J21

Days to delivery 15 days 15 days

25 Additional Items (% off) 5% 15% 5%

Blauer MSRP 15%                  

Dutyman MSRP 23%                              

Peerless MSRP 22.5%                                     

Safariland MSRP 28.5%                  

SanMar MSRP 18% 20%

Vendor shall comply with yes yes yes yes yes

15-day delivery

Vendor shall notify department yes yes yes yes yes

of anticipated delays

Bob Barker Company, Inc.                                 

134 North Main Street                                

Fuquay-Varina NC  27526                            

Attn:  Robin Finn                                    

ph:  800-334-9880                        

fx:  800-322-7537                                

robinfinn@bobbarker.com

GT Distributors, Inc.               

2545 Brockton Drive, 

Suite 100                           

Austin TX  78758                         

Attn:  David Curtis                      

ph:  800-252-8310                 

fx:  800-480-5845                       

txbids@gtdist.com                     

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.       

PO Box 21056                 

Waco TX  76702               

Attn:  Maegan Eisenman      

ph:  800-524-5427                              

fx:  254-751-0299                         

bids@icswaco.com    

Red the Uniform Tailor       

71 Esplanade Boulevard, 

Suite 200                    

Houston TX  77060                 

Attn:  Jeff Mitchell                

ph:  281-931-0006                     

fx:  281-931-0026                       

jeff.mitchell@rtut.com

Texas Code Blue             5550 

Eastex Freeway, Suite L                  

Beaumont TX  77708                    

Attn:  Tony Cervantes                     

ph:  409-892-7836                   

fx:  409-892-7826                      

tony@texascodeblue.com


