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Re-bid Term Contract for Road Building Materials for Jefferson County
FINAL Tabulation 

Price Per Ton, F.O.B. Delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Centers 
with Freight Prepaid and Allowed.

1A.  Rock Asphalt - Truck Delivery
China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.

A.
Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregated for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $77.25 $77.25
2. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.50 $77.25 $77.25
3. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.00 $78.25 $78.25

B.
Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr4 $80.70 $79.75 $79.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.50 $77.75 $77.75

Price Per Ton, F.O.B. Delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Centers 
with Freight Prepaid and Allowed.

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

A.
Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregated for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.50 $74.25 $72.75 $75.75
2. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.00 $74.75 $73.25 $76.25
3. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.50 $75.25 $73.75 $76.75

B.
Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr4 $78.00 $82.35 $82.35 $79.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.00 $74.75 $73.25 $76.25

Price Per Ton, F.O.B. Delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and Allowed.

1C.  Rock Asphalt - Railroad Delivery
China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.

A.
Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregated for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00
2. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00
3. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00

B.
Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00

Price Per Ton, F.O.B. Delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and Allowed.

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert

A.
Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Aggregated for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00 $64.00
2. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00 $64.00
3. Item 302 Type PB Gr 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00 $64.00

B.
Precoated Rock Asphalt Aggregates for Surface 
Treatments:

1. Item 302 Type PB Gr4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00 $64.00 $64.00

1B.  Rock Asphalt - Truck Delivery

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

MINIMUM ORDER OF 
4,000 TONS.

1D.  Rock Asphalt - Railroad Delivery APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

MINIMUM ORDER OF 4,000 TONS
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Re-bid Term Contract for Road Building Materials for Jefferson County
FINAL Tabulation (Continued)

2.  Flexible Base, Item 247, TyA, Gr 1 CLA  (Minimum P.I. 4 - Maximum P.I. 10)
     
A.  Truck Delivery - Prices F.O.B. Delivered with Freight Prepaid and Allowed by Type of Equipment Indicated.

Flexible Base - Price per Ton Delivered from
Vendor's Hopper to Job Site - Bidder shall supply
material from location closest to the County project site.

1.  1-10 Miles
2.  11-20 Miles
3.  21-30 Miles
4.  31+ Miles

B.  Hopper Pick-Up

Location
1.  Beaumont
2.  Port Neches
3.  Port Arthur
4.  Other 
5.  Other

Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation: 

A. Truck Delivery - Prices F.O. B. Delivered with Freight Prepaid and Allowed by type of Equipment Indicated.

Patching Material - Price Per Ton Delivered from
Vendor's Hopper to Job Site. Bidder shall supply
material from location closest to the County
project site.

1.  1-10 Miles
2.  11-20 Miles
3.  21-30 Miles
4.  31+ Miles

B. Hopper Pick-Up

Location
1.  Beaumont
2.  Port Neches
3.  Port Arthur
4.  Other 
5.  Other

Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation: 

APAC-Texas Vulcan Materials Company

Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

Address

3.         CMD-9000-02  Asphaltic Concrete Patching Material  (Stockpile Storage)

Monday-Friday: 7:00 am - 4:00 pm

No Bid$0.00 No Bid
No Bid$0.00 No Bid
No BidNo Bid
No Bid$0.00 No Bid
No Bid860 Pine Street, Beaumont, 77701 $95.00 No Bid

Address Price Per Ton F.O.B. Address Price Per Ton F.O.B. Address Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

No Bid No BidNo Bid No Bid$108.20 $103.80

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Price per Ton,    
Tandem Dump Price per Ton,    Trailer

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Price per Ton,          
Tandem Dump

Price per Ton,         
Trailer

$102.70 $100.35
$105.85 $101.60

$100.00 $99.30

Price per Ton,         
Tandem Dump

Price per Ton,         
Trailer

APAC-Texas

Martin Marietta Materials

2525 Dollinger Rd. Beaumont, 77703
No Bid

2190 Gulfway Dr., Pt. Arthur, 77640 $24.00

APAC-Texas Vulcan Materials Company

Monday-Friday: 6 am - 6pm     Saturday: 6 am - 12 pm Monday-Friday: 6:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Address

Price per Ton,         
Trailer

Martin Marietta Materials
Price per Ton,          
Tandem Dump

Price per Ton,         
Trailer

Price per Ton,    
Tandem Dump

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$29.35 $28.15
$31.70 $28.50
$33.20 $29.95
$34.95 $33.25

Price per Ton,    
Tandem Dump Price per Ton,    Trailer

$26.00 $24.25
$27.35 $25.55
$29.21 $27.35

$31.25

Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

$24.00

$34.00

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

$22.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

1399 Carroll St., Beaumont, 77701
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FINAL Tabulation (Continued)

Price Per Ton, F.O.B. Delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and Allowed.
4A.  Cement Stabilized Base - Truck Delivery

China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.
A-1. Item 276, Plant Mix, Class L, Crushed Stone,             

(1 1/2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.00 $40.00 $40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert
A-2. Item 276, Plant Mix, Class L, Crushed Stone,             

(1 1/2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.00 $40.50 $41.00 $40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.
B-1. Item 276, Plant Mix, Class M, Crushed Stone,            

(2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.00 $42.00 $42.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert
B-2. Item 276, Plant Mix, Class M, Crushed Stone,            

(2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.00 $42.50 $43.00 $42.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.
C-1. Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           

(1 1/2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert
C-2 Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           

(1 1/2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.
D-1. Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           

(2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid $82.00 $82.00 $82.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert
D-2. Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           

(2 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $82.00 $82.00 $82.00 $82.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TRAILER DELIVERY:

TRAILER DELIVERY: 25 TON LOADS

TRAILER DELIVERY:

TRAILER DELIVERY: 25 TON LOADS

25 TON LOADS

25 TON LOADS

PER CUBIC YARD

PER CUBIC YARD

PER CUBIC YARD

Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

PER CUBIC YARD

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company
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Re-bid Term Contract for Road Building Materials for Jefferson County
FINAL Tabulation (Continued)

China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.
E-1. Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           

(3 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.00 $86.00 $86.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale LaBelle Hamshire Hebert
E-2. Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           

(3 sack/ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.00 $86.00 $86.00 $86.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4B.  Cement Stabilized Base - Hopper Pick Up

A. Item 276, Plant Mix, Class L, Crushed Stone              
(1 1/2 sack/ton) 1. Beaumont

2. Port Neches
3. Port Arthur

B. Item 276, Plant Mix, Class M, Crush Stone                 
(2 sack/ton)

1. Beaumont
2. Port Neches
3. Port Arthur

C. Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           
(1 1/2 sack/ton)

1. Beaumont
2. Port Neches

3. Port Arthur

D. Item 401 Flowable Backfill                                            
(2 sack/ton)

1. Beaumont
2. Port Neches

3. Port Arthur

Vulcan Materials Company

PER CUBIC YARD

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

PER CUBIC YARD

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

2190 S. Gulfway Drive    
Pt. Arthur,  77640 $82.00

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

2525 Dollinger Rd.          
Beaumont, 77703 $82.00

No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

No Bid
No Bid

Location

4. Other 
5. Other

Address

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Location

4. Other 
5. Other

Address

Vulcan Materials Company
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Vulcan Materials Company

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

No Bid

No Bid

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Martin Marietta Materials

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

2525 Dollinger Rd.          
Beaumont, 77703 $38.00

No Bid
No Bid

Location

4. Other 
5. Other

APAC-Texas

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Vulcan Materials Company

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No BidNo Bid

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

2525 Dollinger Rd.          
Beaumont, 77703 $36.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Location

4. Other 
5. Other

Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping PointAddress

Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

Address
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

2525 Dollinger Rd.          
Beaumont, 77703 $80.00

No Bid
2190 S. Gulfway Drive    
Pt. Arthur,  77640 $80.00

PER CUBIC YARD

PER CUBIC YARD
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E. Item 401, Flowable Backfill                                           
(3 sack/ton)

1. Beaumont
2. Port Neches

3. Port Arthur

5. Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - Hopper Pick-Up

A. Item 340 TYD

1. Beaumont
2. Port Neches
3. Port Arthur

Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation:

B. Item 340 TYD 
Anti Stripping Agent shall be added  
if required by design mix.

1. Beaumont
2. Port Neches
3. Port Arthur

Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation:

     Concrete Pavement  -  Hopper Pick-Up

1. Beaumont
2. Port Neches
3. Port Arthur

Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation: Hours of Hopper Operation:

5. Other

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Location

4. Other 

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

860 Pine St.,                    
Beaumont 77701 $68.00

Vulcan Materials Company
Address Truck Shipping Point

Address Price Per Ton F.O.B. 

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

No Bid
No Bid

Address Truck Shipping Point
2525 Dollinger Rd.          
Beaumont, 77703 $86.00

No Bid
2190 S. Gulfway Drive    
Pt. Arthur,  77640 $86.00

No Bid
No Bid

Address Truck Shipping Point

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Address Price Per Ton F.O.B. 

No Bid

Address Price Per Ton F.O.B. 

No Bid

Mon.-Fri.: 7:00 am - 4:00 pm

No BidNo BidNo Bid

4. Other 
5. Other

Address Truck Shipping Point
860 Pine St.,                    
Beaumont 77701 $68.00

No Bid
No Bid

5. Other
4. Other 

Location

Location

No Bid
No Bid

Mon.-Fri.: 7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address Truck Shipping Point

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Address

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Truck Shipping Point

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

6.  Hot Mix Cold Laid Asphaltic  
Location

4. Other $0.00
5. Other

Address Truck Shipping Point

860 Pine St.,                    
Beaumont 77701 $80.35

$0.00
$0.00

Mon.-Fri.: 7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address

No Bid
No Bid

Address Truck Shipping Point

No Bid

No Bid
No BidNo Bid$0.00

Vulcan Materials Company

Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Materials Company

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials

Truck Shipping Point

PER CUBIC YARD

APAC-Texas Martin Marietta Materials
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7.  Concrete Structures - Truck Delivery

A. Delivered to Job Site, Jefferson County
1.  Item 421 Class A
2.  Item 421 Class B
3.  Item 421 Class S

Martin Marietta 
MaterialsAPAC-Texas

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Price per Ton F.O.B.  
Truck Shipping Point
No Bid

$84.00
$88.00

Price per Ton F.O.B.  
Truck Shipping Point

PER CUBIC YARD
No Bid$92.00

Vulcan Materials 
Company

Price per Ton F.O.B.  
Truck Shipping Point

APAC-Texas
PO Box 20779
Beaumont, TX  77720

Martin Marietta Materials
505 Orleans, Suite 200
Beaumont, TX  77701

Vulcan Materials Company
1399 Caroll Street
Beaumont, TX 77701

Contact: Rebecca Rutledge
409-284-2600 phone
409-866-5541 fax
rhrutledge@apac.com

Contact: Bill Kelley
409-835-4933 phone
409-654-3312 fax
william.kelley@martinmarietta.com

Contact: Byron Fischer
409-779-9204 phone
409-212-9374 fax
Fischerb@vmcmail.com
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