
IFB 14-009/JW
Term Contract for Microfilm Supplies for Jefferson County

Final Tabulation

DecisionOne 
Corporation

Information 
Management 
Services

Precision 
Micrographics 
& Imaging, Inc.

Western 
Micrographics & 
Imaging 
Systems

Item
Catalog               
Number Description

Est. 
Qty.

Unit of     
Measure

Brand         
Name Price Price Price Price

1 102-2490 Imagelink                          
Archive Processor 
Developer

45 Case Imagelink $98.40 $98.00 $160.00   $111.48

2 102-2656 Imagelink                          
Archive Processor Fixer    

30 Case Imagelink $61.96 $65.00 $96.00 $70.20

3 199-0977 Kodak Prostar                   
Tape & Dispenser

20 Each Kodak $30.35 $31.00 $50.00 $33.98

4 146-5194 Imagelink                          
16mm dual strand

20 Box Imagelink $57.15 $22.00 $78.00 $64.80

5 78-6969-              
7542-0

3M Brand                          
Cartridges for Microfilm 

12 Case 3M $536.50 NO BID $7.24 ea.*          
*No per case          
price given

$576.00

6 78-8000-2580-7 3M Brand                          
Cartridge Leader               
transparent – 100/per 
case

10 Case 3M $85.00 NO BID $1.15 ea.*          
*No per case          
price given

$114.66

7 E030217 Direct Duplication 
Microfilm                           
E-Star Base - 20 rolls/per 
case             

15 Case Imagelink $2,563.00 $1,575.00 $242.90*            
*No per case          
price given

$3,006.72

8 33NXDM              Imagelink                          
Archive Storage Media     
100 rolls/per case             

14 Case Imagelink $3,015.00 $2,795.00 $26.69*              
*No per case          
price given

$3,421.20
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Management 
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Precision 
Micrographics 
& Imaging, Inc.
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Imaging 
Systems
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9 314NXQC Imagelink HQSP615         
16mm X 215 ft.                 
100 rolls/per case

5 Case Kodak $2,400.00 $2,295.00 $2,079.00 $2,680.80

10 833-0896 Kodak Film                        
16mm x 30.5 m.                

7 Roll Kodak $23.25         
per roll

NO BID $20.76         per 
roll

$2,635.20

11 149-0481          Kodak                                
Microfilm Press 16mm – 
not perforated,                  
500 splices

8 Box Kodak $60.00 NO BID $70.00 $44.28

12 150-0719             Kodak System Cleaner -
for Developer                    
10 gallons/per case

4 Case Kodak $127.60 $135.00 $169.00 $142.68

13 139-5110 Kodak                                
System Cleaner for Fixer  
4 gallons/per case             

4 Case Kodak $152.00 $149.00 $16.53*              
*No per case          
price given

$165.60

14 863-2150 Toner Cartridge for 
Kodak ImageLink 
Retrieval Workstation 
1000

25 Each Kodak $337.90 $319.00 $359.00              
Vendor Note: "if    
available"

NO BID

15 144-2433    Kodak                                
Solid Flange Return 
Reels                                 
35mm, 100 ft., Thread-
Easy

10 Case Kodak $180.00 $169.00 $210.00 $194.40

16 FR #32-049 Pro-Star Plus Developer - 
4 gallons/per case            

4 Case FR 
Chemical

NO BID NO BID $94.00 $105.60
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17 FR-32-254 Pro-Star Microfilm Fixer – 
4 gallons/per case             

4 Case FR 
Chemical

NO BID NO BID $84.00 $78.00

18 FR-4900FC      Fixer Systems Cleaner-    
6 Quarts/per case

1 Case FR 
Chemical

NO BID NO BID $78.00 $81.60

19 873-0715 Kodak                                
16mm solid flange             
return microfilm reels        
500/per case

1 Case Kodak $255.00 $219.00 $375.00 $270.00

DecisionOne Corporation Precision Micrographics & Imaging, Inc.
12760 Danielson Court, Suite F 8204 N. Lamar, Suite C-20
Poway, CA  92064 Austin, TX  78753
Contact: Jeanette Anderson Contact: R.W. Gerstenberg
619-434-1952 phone 512-832-6602 phone
800-984-6443 fax 512-832-5301 fax
jeanette.anderson@decisionone.com premicro@aol.com

Information Management Services Western Micrographics & Imaging Systems
5047 Transamerica Drive 11665 Fuqua Street, Ste. C308
Columbus, OH  43228 Houston, TX  77034
Contact: Tom Beazley Contact: Ruth J. Shearer
800-765-0084 phone 800-987-0482 phone
806-744-1775 fax 281-481-8833 alt. phone
tbeazley@imsimaging.com 281-481-8838 fax

west4320@sbcglobal.net
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