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Item 1 Item 2 Item 3
MSMA Herbicide Tordon 101 Herbicide or Equivalent Roundup Herbicide or Equivalent
2.5 gal. container 2.5 gal. container 2.5 gal. container
Est. Qty. = 700 gal. Est. Qty. = 700 gal. Est. Qty. = 700 gal.

Price per Price per Price per
Vendor Gallon Brand Gallon Brand Gallon Brand

ADAPCO, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alligare, LLC No Bid $21.95 Alligare, LLC $11.05 Alligare, LLC

Picloram+D Glyphosate 4 +
Crop Production Services $22.50 p/gL. Target 6x $40.40 p/gL. Tordon 101 $11.90 p/gL. Mad Dog
CWC Chemical, Inc. $23.76 /gal. Drexel (MSMA 6 Plus) $40.40 /gal. DOW $15.94/gal. Ranger Pro Monsanto

John Deere Landscapes $26.14/gal.
Drexel MSMA        6.6 - 
2.5 gal #097155 No Bid $13.64/gal.

LESCO Prosecutor Pro 
2.5 gal. #069289

Red River Specialties $22.50 MSMA 6.0 $36.24 Tordon 101 M $11.26 Razor
Target Specialty Products No Bid No Bid $15.30 Glyphosate Pro-4
Winfield Solutions, LLC $20.11 Drexel 6 Plus $35.45 Tordon 101 $11.40 Ranger Pro  

Item 4** Item 5* Item 6
Rodeo Herbicide or Equivalent Nalco Trol II or Equivalent Aqua-King Surfactant or Equivalent
2.5 gal. container
Est. Qty. = 100 gal. Est. Qty. = 100 gal. Est. Qty. = 400 gal.

Price per Price per Price per
Vendor Gallon Brand Gallon Brand Gallon Brand

ADAPCO, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alligare, LLC $13.85 Alligare, LLC $31.60 Alligare No Bid

Glyphosate 5.4 per 4 qts/gal. Drift/Dep. (12X1 qt./ease)

Crop Production Services $15.50 p/gL. Aqua Neat
$40.00/per gal.  
$10.00/per qt. Poly Control $15.65 Spreader 90

CWC Chemical, Inc. $18.96/gal. DOW $29.60/gal. CWC No Bid

John Deere Landscapes $19.50/gal.
Riverdale Aquaneat 
2.5 gal. #089255 No Bid No Bid

Red River Specialties $15.50 Rodeo
$35.60/per gal. 
$8.90 /per qt. Poly Control 2 (in qts) $24.84 Elite Amplify in 2.5 gal.

Target Specialty Products No Bid $15.20/per gal. Sta-Put Plus $16.39 Pro-Spreader Activator
Winfield Solutions, LLC $13.91 Aquamaster $49.00 Corral Poly $25.00 Aqua-King Plus

*Item 5 reawarded 5/14/12
**Item 4 reawarded 6/4/12
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2.5 gal. container (or smaller) container 2.5 gal. container (or smaller) container
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Item 7 Item 8 Item 9
Malathion Insecticide Scourge Insecticide Aqua-Reslin Insecticide
Bulk Shipment Only 5 gal. containers 2.5 gal. plastic container
Est. Qty. = 20,000 gal. Est. Qty. = 250 gal. Est. Qty. = 600 gal.

Price per Price per Price per
Vendor Gallon Brand Gallon Brand Gallon Brand

ADAPCO, Inc. $ 33.28/gl Fyfanon (Bulk) $ 436.62/gl Scourge $ 143.89/gl Aqua Pursuit
Alligare, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Crop Production Services No Bid No Bid No Bid
CWC Chemical, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
John Deere Landscapes No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red River Specialties No Bid No Bid No Bid
Target Specialty Products No Bid No Bid $159.40 Aqualuer

$143.76 Envion
Winfield Solutions, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 10 Item 11
Agnique Monomolecular Surface Film Duet Adulticide
Bulk Shipment Only 275 gal. steel containers
Est. Qty. = 1,500 gal. Est. Qty. = 1,375 gal.

Price per Price per
Vendor Gallon Brand Gallon Brand

ADAPCO, Inc. $ 34.70/gl.
Agnique MMF*   
(Bulk Ship Only) No Bid

Alligare, LLC No Bid  No Bid
Crop Production Services No Bid No Bid
CWC Chemical, Inc. No Bid No Bid
John Deere Landscapes No Bid No Bid
Red River Specialties No Bid No Bid
Target Specialty Products No Bid No Bid
Winfield Solutions, LLC No Bid No Bid

for Jefferson County Mosquito Control District
IFB 12-011/JW, Term Contract for Insecticides, Herbicides, Spray Adjuvants, and Adulticides


