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Term Contract for Sheriff's Department (Jefferson County) Law Enforcement Equipment and Uniforms
Preliminary Tabulation - July 6, 2011

Item Description 10-32 Supply
Lawmen's & 

Shooters Lone Star Uniform Texas Code Blue

1 Male Prestige Advance NO BID NO BID 73.50 65.00
Trouser - Elbeco

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco E494 Elbeco E474
Days to delivery 20 15-30

2 Male Prestige Advance NO BID NO BID 52.95 50.00
Long Sleeve Shirt

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco E840 840
Days to delivery 20 15-30

3 Male Prestige Advance NO BID NO BID 48.95 46.00
Short Sleeve Shirt

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 8840 8840
Days to delivery 15 15-30

4 Female Prestige Advance NO BID NO BID 52.95 50.00
Long Sleeve Shirt

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9340 9340
Days to delivery 15 15-30

5 Female Prestige Advance NO BID NO BID 48.95 46.00
Short Sleeve Shirt

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9840 9840
Days to delivery 15 15-30

6 Female Prestige Advance NO BID NO BID 73.50 65.00
Trouser Elbeco

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco E9494 E9474
Days to delivery 15 15-30

7 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/ NO BID NO BID 34.00 36.00
Zipper - Female
Long Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9314 Z9314
Days to delivery 15 15-30

8 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/ NO BID NO BID 31.00 34.00
Zipper - Female
Short Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9814 Z9814
Days to delivery 15 15-30

9 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/Zip NO BID NO BID 34.00 36.00
Male Long Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco Z314 Z314
Days to delivery 15 15-30

10 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/Zip NO BID NO BID 31.00 34.00
Male Short Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco Z3314 Z3314
Days to delivery 15 15-30

11 Male Tex-Trop Trouser NO BID NO BID 35.00 39.00
Style E314

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco E314 E314
Days to delivery 15 15-30

12 Elbeco Tex-Trop NO BID NO BID 34.00 33.00
Female Long Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9314 9314
Days to delivery 15 15-30
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13 Elbeco Tex-Trop NO BID NO BID 31.00 32.00
Female Short Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9814 9814
Days to delivery 15 15-30

14 Elbeco Tex-Trop NO BID NO BID 34.00 33.00
Male Long Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco Z314 314
Days to delivery 15 15-30

15 Elbeco Tex-Trop NO BID NO BID 31.00 32.00
Male Short Sleeve

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco Z3314 3314
Days to delivery 15 15-30

16 Female Tex-Trop Trouser NO BID NO BID 35.00 39.00
Style E9314

Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco E9314 E9314
Days to delivery 15 15-30

17 Jacket NO BID NO BID 92.00 109.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Gerber 71N1 Spiewak waterproof S310

Days to delivery 15 15-30

18 Polo Shirt NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.80
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco UFX

Days to delivery 15-30

19 Horace Small Sentry NO BID NO BID 59.95 139.00
Windbreaker

Manufacturer/Style No. Horace Small Spiewak S315V
Days to delivery 15 15-30

20 Name Badge NO BID 6.91 9.95 12.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Blackinton J2 Blackinton Blackinton J2

Days to delivery 15-20 15 15

21 Raincoat NO BID 40.62 (S-XL) NO BID 98.00
44.25 (3XL-6XL)

Min order 3**
Manufacturer/Style No. Neese #447RSC3M Spiewak S309 w/ emb.

Days to delivery 30-45 15-30

22 Belt - Safariland Model 87 68.00 38.44 NO BID 48.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Don Hum #B101-A-S-L Gould & Goodrich B59FL4R

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30

23 Belt - Safariland Model 99 48.00 21.97 NO BID 28.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Don Hum #B125-FV G&G B55

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30

24 Belt - Safariland Model 852 56.00 NO BID NO BID 30.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland G&G B191

Days to delivery 15 15-30

25 Cuff Case - Safariland 190 48.00 17.74 NO BID 24.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Don Hume C303 G&G B580

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30

26 Cuff Case - Safariland 090 42.00 12.00 NO BID 26.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Don Hum C306-1 Safariland 090

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30
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27 Baton Holder 36.00 15.05 NO BID 22.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Model 35 Don Hume #C121 G&G B560

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30

28 Holster Level III Safariland 6360 148.00 NO BID NO BID 135.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland SAF 6360

Days to delivery 15 15-30

29 Holster Level III Safariland 070 158.00 NO BID NO BID 129.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland SAF 070

Days to delivery 15 15-30

30 Double Magazine Holder Saf 70 58.00 21.22 NO BID 28.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Don Hume #D407-2S G&G B627

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30

31 Double Magazine Holder 32.00 NO BID NO BID 26.00
Safariland Model 75

Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland G&G K617
Days to delivery 15 15-30

32 OC Spray Holder 36.00 16.96 NO BID 22.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Don Hume #C309-F G&G 682-3

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30

33 Belt Keepers 6.00 4.01 NO BID 22.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Don Hume #S502-2 G&G B76

Days to delivery 15 30-90 15-30

34 S.O. Lapel Pin NO BID 6.69 pr. NO BID 8.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Blackinton A4287,A7407 

or A7362
S.O. Blackinton

Days to delivery 30-90 15-30

35 Traffic Vest NO BID 22.25 (M/XL) NO BID 44.00
25.29 (2XL/4XL)
28.79 (5XL/7XL)

Manufacturer/Style No. Carolina Safety Sport 
LUV-207-3G-SHF

Spiewak 5912

Days to delivery 3-4 weeks 15-30

36 Handcuffs, Nickel 32.00 17.68 NO BID 26.00
Manufacturer/Style No. S&W CTS/Thompson #1010 SW100

Days to delivery 15 30 15-30

37 Red Cone Stinger 9.00 4.84 NO BID 9.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 75903 75903

Days to delivery 15 30 15

38 Red Cone SL20 10.00 5.33 NO BID 10.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 22511 22511

Days to delivery 15 30 15

39 Stinger Flashlight 128.00 75.39 NO BID 99.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 75014 75014

Days to delivery 15 30 15

40 Stinger Flashlight Battery 26.00 14.32 NO BID 15.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 75175 D8005

Days to delivery 15 30 15

41 Stinger Flashlight Bulb 11.00 6.42 NO BID 7.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 75914 75914



Days to delivery 15 30 15
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42 Stinger Flashlight Lens Kit NO BID 9.10 NO BID 12.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 75956 75956

Days to delivery 30 15

43 Stinger DS LED - aluminum 138.00 93.97 NO BID 120.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 75813 75813

Days to delivery 15 30 15

44 Stinger DS LED - polymer 138.00 93.97 NO BID 115.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 76813 76813

Days to delivery 15 30 15

45 SC20XP LED Flashlight - alum. 138.00 95.26 NO BID 95.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 20203 25103

Days to delivery 15 30 15

46 SC20XP LED Flashlight - nylon 118.00 78.05 NO BID 115.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight Streamlight 25103 20203

Days to delivery 15 30 15

47 Maglite Flashlight 118.00 79.84 NO BID 85.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Maglight Maglight #RN1019 RX1019

Days to delivery 15 30 15

48 Maglite Flashlight Battery 36.00 17.75 NO BID 22.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Maglight Maglight ARXX075 D8001

Days to delivery 15 30 15

49 Maglite Flashlight Bulb 7.00 4.54 NO BID 4.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Maglight Maglight LR00001 LR00001

Days to delivery 15 30 15

50 ASP Baton, Black 95.00 NO BID NO BID 68.00
Manufacturer/Style No. ASP FB52611

Days to delivery 15 15

51 Kevlar Gloves 48.00 NO BID NO BID 26.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Damascus DSX-100

Days to delivery 15 15

52 Leg Irons, Standard 48.00 34.58 NO BID 45.00
Manufacturer/Style No. S&W CTS/Thompson 9000 SW1900

Days to delivery 15 30 15

53 Molded One-Piece Seat Org. 79.00 50.21 NO BID 48.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Progard D2950 Proguard D2950

Days to delivery 15 30-45 15

54 Additional Items (% off) NO BID Neese 20% 25% 28%
Don Hune 30%

CTS/Thompson 30%
Blackinton 30%

Days to delivery 30-45

55 Ballistic Vests (% off) NO BID NO BID 40% 36%
Manufacturer/Style No. Point Blank PACA KXP IIIA

Days to delivery 30 30-45

Vendor shall comply with (Left blank) No Yes* Yes   No
15-day delivery

Vendor shall notify department (Left blank) Yes Yes Yes
of anticipated delays



* Body armor - 30 days
** Minimum order - disqualifies bid.


