
IFB 11-015/AW
Term Contract for Microfilm Supplies for Jefferson County
Preliminary Tab (using Revised Bid Form, Addendum 1)
April 12, 2011

Decision One Micro Images

Item Description
Unit of 

Measure Unit Price Unit Price
1 Kodak Prostar Plus Developer - 4 gal/case Case 125.60 122.50

Cat No:  102-2490
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E022301 102-2490

2 Kodak Prostar Plus Fixer - 4 gal/case Case 80.20 77.15
Cat No:  102-2656
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E022302 19202656

3 Kodak Tape and Dispenser processing Each 26.15 35.00
Cat No:  199-0977
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E022125 199-0977

4 Kodak Prostar 16MM Dual Strand Self-Threader - 3/box Box 49.00 55.00
Cat No:  146-5194
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E022127 146-5194

5 3M Brand Cartridges for Microfilm - 100/case Case 230.00 NO BID
Cat No:  78-6969-7542-0
Brand Name: Zeta Products
Item No: Z043901

6 3M Cartride Leader - transparent - 100/case Case 75.00 NO BID
Cat No:  78-8000-2580-7
Brand Name: Zeta Products
Item No: Z044103

7 Print Film - Kodak Direct Duplication Microfilm - E-Star Case 587.00 543.80
Base - 10 rolls/case
Cat No:  810-5652
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E023504 810-5652

8 Kodak Archive Storage Media - 20 rolls/case Case 409.00 379.00
215 ft. rolls, 16x66 mm.
Cat No:  862-5147
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E021746 862-5147

9 Kodak ImageLink HW SP615 -16mm x 215 ft. - 20 rolls/case Case 433.00 366.00
Cat No:  845-1502
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E021506 845-1502

10 Kodak Film - 16mm x 30.5m. - 20 rolls/case Roll 587.00 NO BID
Cat No:  810-5652
Brand Name: Kodak
Item No: E023504

11 Chem-Pak - Docucopy - 10 packs/case Case NO BID NO BID
Cat No:  E-62006105
Brand Name:
Item No:
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12 Kodak 16mm Film Box w/ label space - white - 1000/cs Case 170.35 236.00
Cat No:  1-535
Brand Name: Microfilm Products Microfilm Products
Item No: M202120 1-535

13 NRX Duplicating Film - white strip - 1000 sheets/box Box NO BID NO BID
Cat No:  78-6178-8030-0
Brand Name:
Item No:

14 Clear Tab Jackets - Rib - 1000/box Cat No. TA-243 Box 88.95 105.00
Brand Name: Indus International NB Microseal
Item No: I053030 TA-243

16 Kodak Microfilm Press - 16mm not perforated - 500 splices Box 50.00 60.00
Cat No:  106-3429
Brand Name: Zeta Products Microfilm Products
Item No: Z043951 1-530

18 Kodak System Cleaner - for Fixer - 10 pack/case Case 115.30 103.75
Cat No:  139-5100
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E022321 139-5110

19 35nn 100 ft. thread easy return reels Each NO BID NO BID
Cat No:  144-243
Brand Name:
Item No:

20 MP-20 Negative Cartridges for roll film machines Each NO BID NO BID
Cat No:  M-95-0411-019
Brand Name:
Item No:

21 Minolta MT Toner - for Minolta Viewer Cat No. 8910-404 Each NO BID NO BID
Brand Name:
Item No:

22 Toner Cartridge for Kodak ImageLink Retrieval Each 333.00 298.00
Cat No:  863-2150
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E021622 863-2150

23 Kodak 16mm Film - w/o processing - 20 rolls/case Case 216.80 195.00
Cat No:  822-3232
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E021510 822-3232

24 Kodak 16mm Solid Flange return reels - 300/case Case 207.00 195.00
Cat No:  873-0714 873-0715
Brand Name: Kodak Kodak
Item No: E021671 873-0714

25 Fuji Microfilm System Cleaner Case 53.00 NO BID
Cat No:  141
Brand Name: Microfilm Products
Item No: M201191

26 24 X CDR Media - 650 MB w/ Jewel Case - 600/pack Each NO BID 0.30
Brand Name: Mitsui
Item No: 9533


