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Item Description 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10

1 Coverall - Yellow, X-Sm No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid 1 Acme Supply Co Ltd
Coverall - Yellow, Sm No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid 10 Cedar Swamp Road, #7
Coverall - Yellow, M No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.00 No Bid Glen Cove, NY  11542
Coverall - Yellow, L No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.50 No Bid Attn:  Sandra Bailey
Coverall - Yellow, XL No Bid 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 9.00 No Bid Phone:  800-567-8025
Coverall - Yellow, 1XL No Bid 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 9.25 No Bid Fax:  800-567-8026
Coverall - Yellow, 2XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 9.50 No Bid bn@acmesupply.us
Coverall - Yellow, 3XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 9.75 No Bid
Coverall - Yellow, 4XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 10.00 No Bid 2 Bob Barker
Coverall - Yellow, 5XL No Bid 11.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 10.25 No Bid 134 N. Main Street
Coverall - Yellow, 6XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 No Bid Fuquay-Vienna, NC  27526
Coverall - Yellow, 7XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 10.75 No Bid Attn:  Allison Wilmesmeier
Coverall - Yellow, 8XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 11.00 No Bid Phone:  800-334-9880
Coverall - Yellow, 9XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 11.25 No Bid Fax:  800-322-7537
Coverall - Yellow, 10XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 11.50 No Bid allisonwilmesmeier@bobbarker.com
Coverall - Yellow, 11XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid
Coverall - Yellow, 12XL No Bid 14.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid 3 Carolina Textiles
Coverall - Yellow, 13XL No Bid 16.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid PO Box 11211
Coverall - Yellow, 14XL No Bid 16.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Charlotte, NC  28220
Coverall - Yellow, 15XL No Bid 18.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Attn:  Bob Jones
Coverall - Navy Bl, X-Sm No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid Phone:  704-525-1272
Coverall - Navy Bl, Sm No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid Fax:  704-525-0607
Coverall - Navy Bl, M No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.00 No Bid carolinatextiles@netzero.com
Coverall - Navy Bl, L No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.50 No Bid
Coverall - Navy Bl, XL No Bid 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 9.68 No Bid 4 Charm-Tex
Coverall - Navy Bl, 1XL No Bid 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 10.10 No Bid 1618 Coney Island Ave.
Coverall - Navy Bl, 2XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 10.20 No Bid Brooklyn, NY  11230
Coverall - Navy Bl, 3XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 10.74 No Bid Attn:  Stan Danzger
Coverall - Navy Bl, 4XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 11.50 No Bid Phone:  718-252-8100
Coverall - Navy Bl, 5XL No Bid 11.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 11.84 No Bid Fax:  718-258-8303
Coverall - Navy Bl, 6XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 12.29 No Bid Stan@charm-tex.com
Coverall - Navy Bl, 7XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 13.25 No Bid
Coverall - Navy Bl, 8XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 13.25 No Bid 5 Gold Water Industries
Coverall - Navy Bl, 9XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 13.25 No Bid 17221 S. Western Ave.
Coverall - Navy Bl, 10XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 14.00 No Bid Gardena, CA  90247
Coverall - Navy Bl, 11XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Attn:  Jack Wang
Coverall - Navy Bl, 12XL No Bid 14.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Phone:  310-538-4560
Coverall - Navy Bl, 13XL No Bid 16.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Fax:  310-538-5169
Coverall - Navy Bl, 14XL No Bid 16.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid bids@goldwaterusa.com
Coverall - Navy Bl, 15XL No Bid 18.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid
Coverall - Orange, X-Sm No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid 6 ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
Coverall - Orange, Sm No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid PO Box 21056
Coverall - Orange, M No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.00 No Bid Waco, TX  76702
Coverall - Orange, L No Bid 9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.50 No Bid Attn:  Michelle Markum
Coverall - Orange, XL No Bid 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 9.68 No Bid Phone:  800-524-5427
Coverall - Orange, 1XL No Bid 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 10.10 No Bid Fax:  254-751-0299
Coverall - Orange, 2XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 10.20 No Bid icswaco@hotmail.com
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Coverall - Orange, 3XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 10.74 No Bid 7 Kentron Health Care, Inc.
Coverall - Orange, 4XL No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 11.50 No Bid PO Box 120
Coverall - Orange, 5XL No Bid 11.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 11.84 No Bid Springfield, TN  37172
Coverall - Orange, 6XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 12.29 No Bid Attn:  Nari Sadarangani
Coverall - Orange, 7XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 13.25 No Bid Phone:  615-384-0573
Coverall - Orange, 8XL No Bid 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 13.25 No Bid Fax:  615-384-0574
Coverall - Orange, 9XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 13.25 No Bid kentron@kentronmedical.com
Coverall - Orange, 10XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 14.00 No Bid
Coverall - Orange, 11XL No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid 8 Ocuture
Coverall - Orange, 12XL No Bid 14.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid 11930 Camby Park Drive
Coverall - Orange, 13XL No Bid 16.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Houston, TX  77047
Coverall - Orange, 14XL No Bid 16.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Attn:  Craig Davis
Coverall - Orange, 15XL No Bid 18.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Phone:  484-300-2424
Coverall - Red, X-Sm No Bid 9.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid Fax:  832-615-4712
Coverall - Red, Sm No Bid 9.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 7.75 No Bid Craig.davis@ocuture.com
Coverall - Red, M No Bid 9.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.00 No Bid
Coverall - Red, L No Bid 10.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 8.50 No Bid 9 Robinson Textiles
Coverall - Red, XL No Bid 10.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 9.00 No Bid 152 West Walnut, #250
Coverall - Red, 1XL No Bid 10.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid 9.25 No Bid Gardena, CA  90248
Coverall - Red, 2XL No Bid 11.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 9.50 No Bid Attn:  Gary Lovemark
Coverall - Red, 3XL No Bid 11.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid 9.75 No Bid Phone:  800-421-5582
Coverall - Red, 4XL No Bid 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 10.00 No Bid Fax:  800-370-7019
Coverall - Red, 5XL No Bid 12.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid No Bid 10.25 No Bid robtexemail@aol.com
Coverall - Red, 6XL No Bid 13.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 No Bid
Coverall - Red, 7XL No Bid 13.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 10.75 No Bid 10 Tabb Textile Co., Inc.
Coverall - Red, 8XL No Bid 13.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 11.00 No Bid 511 Pleasant Drive
Coverall - Red, 9XL No Bid 13.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 11.25 No Bid Opelika, AL  36801
Coverall - Red, 10XL No Bid 13.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid 11.50 No Bid Attn:  Marsha Thrift
Coverall - Red, 11XL No Bid 13.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Phone:  334-745-6762
Coverall - Red, 12XL No Bid 15.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid Fax:  334-745-2377
Coverall - Red, 13XL No Bid 17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid tabb@textilegroup.net
Coverall - Red, 14XL No Bid 17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid
Coverall - Red, 15XL No Bid 20.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid

2 Navy Cruiser Shoes, 5 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 6 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 7 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 8 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 9 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 10 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 11 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 12 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 13 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 14 No Bid 2.34 No Bid 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 15 No Bid 2.34 2.26 2.72 3.34 5.75 No Bid No Bid 3.88 No Bid

3 Shower Shoes Pr - 5 No Bid No Bid 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 6 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
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Shower Shoes Pr - 7 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 8 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 9 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 10 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 11 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 12 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 13 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 14 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 15 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid
Shower Shoes Pr - 16 No Bid 1.38 2.26 1.54 1.42 1.80 No Bid 1.85 1.43 No Bid

4 Gown - S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gown - M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gown - L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gown - 1XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gown - 2XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gown - 3XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gown - 4XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gown - 5XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Mattress 56.00 42.98 No Bid 37.18 No Bid 35.00 No Bid No Bid 33.88 No Bid

6 Mattress Cover 24.00 5.00* No Bid 5.18 No Bid 6.23 No Bid No Bid 6.00 No Bid
Sold by doz. 

Only

7 Blanket 6.80 4.88 8.65 5.54 No Bid 8.10 No Bid No Bid 7.00 5.20

8 Bath Towel (doz.) 11.00 13.00 14.05 10.54 No Bid 11.20 No Bid No Bid 12.00 5.60
(20"x40") (20"x40") (20"x40")

9 Laundry Bag No Bid 1.80 1.96 2.18 No Bid 2.55 1.95 No Bid 3.30 No Bid
Sold by doz. 
only-12"x24" (24"x36")

Sold by doz. 
only-18"x24"

*Minimum orders not accepted.




