
IFB 09-181/KJS
Term Contract for Law Enforcement Equipment for Jefferson County
Preliminary Tabulation - Page 1 of 2

Item Description 10-32 Supply Adamson Ind. Bob Barker Code Blue GT Distributors Lawmens Mar-Vel Tyler

1 Smith & Wesson 27.00 19.70 19.60 22.00 18.48 17.48 24.14 26.00
Handcuffs - Nickel

Brand Smith & Wesson Smith & Wesson Smith & Wesson Smith & Wesson Thompson Smith & Wesson Smith & Wesson
Stock No. 350103 100 SW100N 350103 1010 350103 100 (350103)

2 Red Cone Stinger 9.00 3.63 5.56 6.00 3.29 6.51 8.34 5.00
Brand Streamlight Stinger Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 75903 75903 75902 75903 75903 75903 75903

3 Red Cone SL20 11.00 3.95 6.39 6.00 3.84 7.11 8.34 6.00
Brand Streamlight Stinger Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 22511 22511 22511 22511 22511 22511 22511

4 Stinger flashlight 89.00 82.65 93.56 97.00 75.14 85.84 61.44 68.75
Brand Streamlight Stinger Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 75014 75014 75014 75014 75014 75000 7500

5 Stinger flashlight batteries 24.00 12.59 14.50 22.00 11.49 15.23 16.64 18.00
Brand Streamlight Stinger Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 75175 75175 D8401 75175 75175 75175 75175

6 Stinger flashlight bulbs 9.50 5.44 6.28 5.00 4.99 8.27 9.34 6.00
Brand Streamlight Stinger Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 75914 75914 75914 75914 75914 75914 75914

7 Stinger flashlight lens kit 19.00 8.49 11.02 10.00 7.49 11.19 55.54 11.00
Brand Streamlight Stinger Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 75956 75956 75956 75956 75956 75160 75956

8 Stinger DS LED 99.00 103.44 90.33 119.00 94.04 105.92 83.34 94.00
Brand Streamlight Stinger DS Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 75813 75810 75813 75813 76813 75810 75810

9 SL20XP LED flashlight 89.00 82.66 98.74 106.00 75.14 85.84 85.54 75.00
Brand Streamlight Stinger Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight

Stock No. 25103 25103 25011 25103 25183 20200 25100

10 Maglight flashlight 89.00 80.84 83.77 93.00 73.71 78.75 107.74 102.00
Brand MagLight Maglite Magcharger MagLight MagLight MagLight Streamlight MagLight

Stock No. RX1019 PLX1019 RX1019 RX1019 RX1019 26010 RX1019

11 Maglight flashlight batteries 34.00 24.70 1.52 22.00 14.36 16.52 33.34 32.00
Brand MagLight MagLight MagLight MagLight MagLight Streamlight MagLight

Stock No. ARX4075 AWXX075* D8001 ARXX235 AWXX075 20170 AWXX075

12 Maglight flashlight bulbs 12.00 3.39 3.49 5.00 2.94 4.60 16.64 5.00
Brand MagLight MagLight MagLight MagLight MagLight Streamlight MagLight

Stock No. LR001 LR00001 LR00001 LR00001 LR00001 20110 LR00001

* sold by the dozen
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13 ASP Baton, black 86.00 58.84 No Bid 68.00 54.79 No Bid 67.74 72.00
Brand MagLight ASP ASP ASP ASP 21"

Stock No. F16FB 52411 52411 F26FB 52411

14 Kevlar Gloves - S, M, L,, XL 35.00 24.76 32.88 25.00 18.78 No Bid 18.84 28.00
Brand Hatch Kevlar SIG Tactical Damascus Hatch Damascus Hatch

Stock No. Resistor RFX 300 803-KS DPG125 KPG200 DNK-1 KED100
Kevlar Gloves - S, M, L,, XL 45.00

Brand Franklin
Stock No. 17310

15 Leg irons, standard 64.00 38.49 34.18 48.00 33.10 34.89 41.14 42.00
Brand Smith & Wesson Peerless Smith & Wesson Smith & Wesson Thompson Peerless Smith & Wesson

Stock No. 350121 703 S&W1900 350121 9000 703 148855

16 Molded one-piece seat 69.00 49.80 No Bid 52.00 31.54 47.61 No Bid 59.00
organizer

Brand Proguard Proguard GT Distributors Progard Progard
Stock No. D2950 D2950 GT-BR-017 D2950 D2950

10-32 Supply Adamson Industries Corp. Bob Barker Company
1048 Neches 45 Research Drive 134 N. Main St.
Beaumont, Texas 77701 Haverhill, MA  01832 Fuquay Varina, NC. 27526
Attn:  Bob Goza Attn:  Kim Contarino Attn:  Allison Wilmesmeier
Phn:  409-832-4475 Ph:  978-681-0370 Phn:  800-334-9880
Fax:  409-832-4481 Fax:  978-975-7169 Fax:  800-322-7537
Supply1032@hotmail.com scontarino@adamsonindustries.com allisonwilmesmeier@bobbarker.com

Code Blue Police Supply GT Distributors, Inc. Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc.
5550 Eastex, Suite L 2545 Brockton Dr., #100 7750 9th St. SW
Beaumont, Texas 77708 Austin, Texas 78758 Vero Beach, FL  32968
Attn:  Todd Methvin Attn:  Preston Wheeless Attn:  Crystal Mazzoli
Phn:  409-892-7836 Phn:  800-252-8310 Ph:  772-569-8700
Fax:  409-892-7826 Fax:  800-480-5845 Fax:  772-569-2955

txbids@gtdist.com bids@lawmens.net

Mar-Vel International Inc. Tyler Uniform, Inc.
7115 Airport Hwy. 228 S. Englewood
Pennsauken, NJ  08109 Tyler, TX  75702
Attn:  Noelle Irish Attn:  Wyndell Roberts
Phone:  856-488-4499 Ph:  800-444-9291
Fax:  856-488-4343 Fax:  903-593-0019
nirish@mar-vel.com wyndell@tyleruniform.com


