
Vendor

KAT Excavation & Construction, Inc.
P.O. Box 1079
Sour Lake, Texas 77659
Attn: Kerry Trest
Phone: 409-287-3455
Fax: 409-287-2600
Excavators & Constructors, LTD
6601 Proctor Ext.
Port Arthur, Texas 77642-0969
Attn: M.J. Braxton
Phone: 409-962-2677
Fax: 409-962-2771
Mid County Materials and Construction

8700 Industrial circle
Port Arthur, Texas 77640
Attn: Mark Vernon
Phone: 409-781-5555
Fax: 409-727-3559
Elkins Tractor & Hauling Svc. LLC
13480 Craigen Rd
Beaumont, Texas 77705
Attn: Jim Elkins
Phone: 
Fax:
Advanced Asset Developments, LLC
7941 Tom Drive
Port Arthur, Texas 77642 
Attn: Esther Benoit
Phone: 409-722-3724
Fax: 409-722-7786

$3.00/cubic yard 
$2.25/ per mile 

delivery

No Bid No Bid $3.00/cubic yard 
$2.25/ per mile 

delivery

$3.00/cubic yard 
$2.25/ per mile 

delivery

$8.00/cubic yard 
$2.25/ per mile 

delivery

$2.50/cubic yard 
$2.25/ per mile 

delivery

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid No Bid $2.50/cubic yard 
$4.00/per mile delivery

No Bid

IFB 09-118/KJS
Term Contract for Dirt for Jefferson County

Pre-Tab August 24, 2009

Item 1 Description: 
60/40

Item 3 Description 
Grey Base 

610

Item 5

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

 $3.00/cubic yard 
$2.85/per mile tandem 
delivery  $4.72/per mile 

truck trailer delivery 

Description: 
Top Soil

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

 $8.00/cubic yard 
$2.85/per mile tandem 
delivery  $4.72/per mile 

truck trailer delivery 

 $2.00/cubic yard 
$2.85/per mile tandem 
delivery  $4.72/per mile 

truck trailer delivery 

Item 2 Description: 
Fill Dirt 

Embankment

Item 4

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

No Bid

Description: 
Sandy Loam

Item 6

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

No Bid No Bid

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

List your Price Per 
Cubic Yard and Price 
Per Mile Delivery Fee 
(see page 15 of the 

No Bid  $8.00/cubic yard 
$2.85/per mile tandem 
delivery  $4.72/per mile 

truck trailer delivery 

Item 7 Description: 
Chip Seal 

Rock Grade 
2

Item 8 Description 
Sand

Description 
Chip Seal 

Rock Grade 
1

$2.50/Cubic yard 
$4.20/per mile 

delivery

$2.50/Cubic yard 
$4.20/per mile 

delivery

$2.50/Cubic yard 
$4.20/per mile 

delivery

No Bid $2.50/Cubic yard 
$4.20/per mile 

delivery

No Bid No Bid $2.50/Cubic yard 
$4.20/per mile 

delivery

$2.00/Cubic yard 
$1.25/per mile 

delivery

$7.00/Cubic yard 
$1.25/per mile 

delivery

$1.50/Cubic yard 
$1.25/per mile 

delivery

$384.00/12tons 
$1.25/per mile 

delivery

$7.00/Cubic yard 
$1.25/per mile 

delivery

No Bid No Bid $2.00/Cubic yard 
$1.25/per mile 

delivery


