
China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd. China Rd. Viterbo Rd. Boyt Rd.
A. Natural Limestone Rock 

Asphalt Aggregated for 
Surface Treatments:

1 Item 302 Type PE  Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.25 $52.25 
2 Item 302 Type PE  Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.25 $52.25 
3 Item 302 Type PE  Gr 4 

Modified
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.25 $52.25 

B. Precoated Rock Asphalt 
Aggregates for Surface 
Treatments:

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.25 $52.25 

Rosedale La Belle Hamshire Hebert Rosedale La Belle Hamshire Herbert Rosedale La Belle Hamshire Hebert
A. Natural Limestone Rock 

Asphalt Aggregated for 
Surface Treatments:

1 Item 302 Type PE Gr 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.75 $52.25 $51.75 

2 Item 302 Type PE Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.75 $52.25 $51.75 

3 Item 302 Type PE Gr 4 
Modified

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.75 $52.25 $51.75 

B. Precoated Rock Asphalt 
Aggregates for Surface 
Treatments:

1 Item 302 Type PB Gr 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.25 $52.75 $52.25 $51.75 

II. Crushed Limestone Base, Item 247, Ty A, Gr 1 CL2 (Minimum P.I. 4 - Maximum P.I. 10)

Price per 
Ton, Trailer

Price per Ton, 
Tandem Dump

Price per 
Ton, Trailer

Knife River 

4825 Romeda Road
Beaumont, TX 77705

Price per Ton, 
Trailer

Price per Ton, 
Tandem 

APAC-Texas

PO Box 20779
Beaumont, TX  77720
Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge

Phone:  409-866-1444

Fax:  409-866-1032

Phone: 409-201-2794
Fax: 281-276-4999

Description

Vulcan Construction Materials LP
12603 Southwest Frway, Suite 300
Stafford, Texas 77477
Attn: Richard Bernard

Knife River 
4825 Romeda Road
Beaumont, TX 77705

Knife River 
4825 Romeda Road

Description

APAC-Texas
PO Box 20779
Beaumont, TX  77720
Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge
Phone:  409-866-1444
Fax:  409-866-1032

I.  Rock Asphalt-Truck Delivery

IA Rock Asphalt-Truck Delivery

Vulcan Construction Materials LP
12603 Southwest Frway, Suite 300
Stafford, Texas 77477
Attn: Richard Bernard
Phone: 409-201-2794
Fax: 281-276-4999

APAC-Texas

PO Box 20779
Beaumont, TX  77720
Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge
Phone:  409-866-1444
Fax:  409-866-1032

Price Per Ton, F.O.B. Delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and Allowed

Beaumont, TX 77705

Price Per Ton, F.O.B. Delivered Jefferson County Precinct Service Centers with Freight Prepaid and Allowed

Vulcan Construction Materials 
LP
12603 Southwest Frway, Suite 
Stafford, Texas 77477
Attn: Richard Bernard
Phone: 409-201-2794
Fax: 281-276-4999

Price per 
Ton, 

IFB 09-116/KJS, Road Building Materials for Jefferson County
Pre-Tab Tabulation

Monday, August 03, 2009



Description
A. Truck Delivery – Prices F.O.B. 

Delivered with Freight Prepaid 
and Allowed by Type of 
Equipment Indicated.  Price 
Per Ton Delivered from 
Vendor’s Hopper to Job Site – 
Bidder shall supply material 
from location closest to the 
County project site.

1.  1 – 10 Miles No Bid No Bid $20.50 $19.50 18.95$         17.95$                
2.  11 – 20 Miles No Bid No Bid $21.50 $20.50 19.95$      18.95$                
3.  21 – 30 Miles No Bid No Bid $22.50 $21.50 20.95$      19.95$                
4.  31+ Miles No Bid No Bid $25.00 $23.00 22.95$      21.45$                

B. Hopper Pick-Up

Address Address Address
1.  Beaumont 2155 North 7th . $17.00 

1399 Carroll St. 14.50$                    
2.  Port Neches
3.  Port Arthur
4.  Other No Bid 2225 Hwy 326 

South, Sour 
Lake

$17.00 

5.  Other
Hours of Hopper 
Operation:
Loose weight in LBS/C.Y.

A. Price per 
Ton, Tandem 

Dump

Price per 
Ton, Trailer

Price per 
Ton, Trailer

Price per 
Ton, Trailer

$90.40 $88.25 No Bid No Bid
$93.00 $89.90 No Bid No Bid
$96.85 $92.45 No Bid No Bid

$101.95 $95.85 No Bid No Bid
B.

Location

Phone: 409-201-2794

Fax: 281-276-4999
Price per Ton, Tandem 

Dump

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid4.  31+ Miles No Bid

Hopper Pick-Up
Price Per Ton F.O.B. 
Truck Shipping Point

Address

2.  11 – 20 Miles No Bid
3.  21 – 30 Miles No Bid

Patching Material – Price Per Ton Delivered from 
Ven-dor’s Hopper to Job Site – Bidder shall supply 
material from location closest to the County 
project site.
1.  1 – 10 Miles No Bid

Truck Delivery – Prices F.O.B. Delivered with 
Freight Prepaid and Allowed by Type of 
Equipment Indicated

Price per Ton, Tandem Dump

APAC-Texas
PO Box 20779
Beaumont, TX  77720
Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge

Phone:  409-866-1444

Fax:  409-866-1032

6 am to 6 pm

2600 #

Location Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

Stafford, Texas 77477
Attn: Richard Bernard

Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

Knife River Corp.
4825 Romeda RD
Beaumont ,TX  77705

Price Per Ton 
F.O.B. Truck 

Shipping Point

12603 Southwest Frway, Suite 300

2700#

Vulcan Construction Materials LP
IV.A.  CMD-9200-002 Asphaltic Concrete Patching Material (Stockpile Storage)

III.  Crushed Slag – Item 247, Gr 1, Type D, Class 2:  NO BID

Dump Tandem 



1.  Beaumont 860 Pine St.
2.  Port Neches
3.  Port Arthur
4.  Other
5.  Other

V.  Cement Stabilized Base, Hopper Pick Up

Address Price Address Price Address Price
A. Item 276, Plant Mix, TY A, 

Crushed Stone (1½ 
sack/ton).
1.  Beaumont No Bid 2177 N. 7th St $23.00 No Bid
2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.  Other No Bid No Bid

B. Item 276, Plant Mix, TY A, 
Crushed Stone 
(2sack/ton).
1.  Beaumont No Bid 2177 N. 7th St $25.00 No Bid
2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.  Other No Bid No Bid

C. Item 276, Plant Mix, TY A, 
Crushed Stone (3sack/ton)

1.  Beaumont No Bid 2177 N. 7th St $29.00 No Bid
2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.  Other No Bid No Bid

D. Item 400, Cement 
Stabilized Sand (1½ 
sack/ton).
1.  Beaumont No Bid 2177 N. 7th St. 

& 6025 
Highland

$16.50 No Bid

2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.  Other No Bid No Bid

E. Item 400, Cement 
Stabilized Sand (2 
sack/ton).
1.  Beaumont No Bid 2177 N. 7th St. 

& 6025 
Highland

$18.50 No Bid

2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid

Attn: Richard Bernard

Phone: 409-201-2794
Fax: 281-276-4999

Price Per Ton F.O.B. Truck Shipping Point
Vulcan Construction Materials 
LP
12603 Southwest Frway, Suite 
Stafford, Texas 77477

Knife River Corp.

4825 Romeda RD
Beaumont ,TX  77705

APAC-Texas

PO Box 20779
Beaumont, TX  77720
Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge

Phone:  409-866-1444

Fax:  409-866-1032

Hours of Hopper Operation: 7 am – 5 pm Mon-Fri

$83.65 



3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.  Other No Bid No Bid

F. Item 400, Cement 
Stabilized Sand (3 
sack/ton).  

No Bid

1.  Beaumont No Bid 2177 N. 7th St. 
& 6025 

Highland

$22.50 No Bid

2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.  Other No Bid No Bid

Hours of Hopper Operation

A.

No Bid
No Bid

B.
No Bid

VII.  Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement – Hopper Pick-Up

A.

Location
1.  Beaumont 860 Pine St. $64.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other Baird’s 

Bayou, 
I10/Rose City

$64.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hours of Hopper 
Operation:

7AM-5PM M-
F

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

APAC-Texas
PO Box 20779
Beaumont, TX  77720
Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge

Phone:  409-866-1444

Fax:  409-866-1032

1.  Item 300, Grade AE-P
Hours of Hopper Operations:
Vendor’s Shipping Point Address:

Price Per 
Gallon F.O.B. 

Truck

1.  Item 300, Grade RS-2 (HVRS)
2.  Item 300, Grade SS-1
Cationic Emulsions

Anionic – Hopper Must Be Within Jefferson County

6:00 AM- 6:00 PM Mon-Sat

VI.               Asphalt Products – Hopper Pick-Up No Bids

Knife River Corp. Vulcan Construction Materials 
4825 Romeda RD 12603 Southwest Frway, Suite 
Beaumont ,TX  77705 Stafford, Texas 77477

Attn: Richard Bernard

Item 340 TY D – Asphaltic Material Content shall be 10-18% by Volume

Phone: 409-201-2794
Fax: 281-276-4999

Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

Price Per Ton 
F.O.B. Truck 

Shipping Point

Address Address Address



B.

Location
1.  Beaumont 860 Pine St. $64.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other Baird’s 

Bayou, 
I10/Rose City

$64.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

A.

Location Address Address Address
1.  Beaumont 860 Pine St. $74.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.  Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.  Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.  Other Baird’s 

Bayou, 
I10/Rose City

$74.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.  Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hours of Hopper 
Operation: :

IX.  Concrete Pavement – Truck Delivery
APAC-Texas

PO Box 20779

Beaumont, TX  77720

Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge
Phone:  409-866-1444
Fax:  409-866-1032

Knife River Corp.

Beaumont, TX  77720
Attn:  Rebecca Rutledge

Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

Knife River Corp. Vulcan Construction Materials 
VIII.  Hot Mix Cold Laid Asphaltic Concrete Pavement – Hopper Pick-Up

Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

Hours of Hopper Operation: 7 am- 5 pm 
Mon-Fri

Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

Price Per Ton 
F.O.B. Truck 

Shipping Point

4825 Romeda RD

Item 340 TY D – Anti Stripping Agent shall be added if required by design mix.  Asphaltic Material Content 
shall be 10-15% by Volume.

Address Address Address

APAC-Texas                           
PO Box 20779

Phone: 409-201-2794
Fax: 281-276-4999

Attn: Richard Bernard

Fax: 281-276-4999

Phone:  409-866-1444

Fax:  409-866-1032

y
Suite 300

Beaumont ,TX  77705 Stafford, Texas 77477

Vulcan Construction 
Materials LP

4825 Romeda RD

A.  Delivered to Job Site, Jefferson County – AGGREGATE

Attn: Richard Bernard
Phone: 409-201-2794

 7 am- 5 pm Mon-Fri No Bid No Bid

Price Per 
Ton F.O.B. 

Truck 
Shipping 

Point

Price Per Ton 
F.O.B. Truck 

Shipping Point

Item 334, Type D

12603 Southwest Frway, Suite 
Beaumont ,TX  77705 Stafford, Texas 77477



Price Per Cubic Yard

F.O.B. Truck Shipping Point

1. Item
421 Class
A (5 sack)
#67

No Bid

2. Item
421 Class
B (4 sack)
#67

No Bid

3. Item
421 Class
S (6.5
sack) #67

No Bid

4. Item
421 Class
A (5 sack)
#67

No Bid

5. Item
421 Class
B (4 sack)
#67

No Bid

6. Item
421 Class
S (6.5
sack) #67

No Bid

7. Item
421 Class
A (5 sack)
#67 

No Bid

** Less
than 6 cy
min Del
Fee (Knife
River Bid)

Price Per Cubic Yard Price Per Cubic YardA.  
Delivered 
to Job
Site, 
Jefferson 
County –
AGGREG
ATE

F.O.B. Truck Shipping Point, 
less than 6 CY Minimum 

Delivery fee of $75.00 per Trip

F.O.B. Truck Shipping Point, 
less than 6 CY Minimum 

Delivery fee of $75.00 per Trip

$78.00 

$74.00 

$82.00 

No Bid

No Bid

$78.00 

$74.00 

$82.00 

$78.00 

$75.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid


